
God kept His promise to Adam and Eve to 
send a Savior! Jesus came as a baby, but 
grew up to be a man that never sinned. He 
died on the cross to take the punishment 
for our sins. But He did not stay dead! He 
rose from dead! And before He went back to 
heaven to be with God, Jesus promised that 
He would come back one day. Jesus Came 
to Save Sinners! And He will come again! At 
Christmas, we do not just celebrate Jesus’ 
birth. We also celebrate that he died on the 
cross and rose from the dead. And one day, 
He will return.

Did God keep His promise to Adam and 
Eve to send Jesus? Yes! God always keeps 
His promises!

What did God put in the sky the night Je-
sus was born? a star

Who saw the star and knew it meant that 
Jesus had been born? the Wise Men

Where were the Wise Men when they saw 
the star? in a far away country

Did the Wise Men come to see Jesus the 
night He was born? no, it took many months 
for the Wise Men to travel to see Jesus

When the Wise Men saw Jesus what did 
they do? worshipped Him and gave Him
special gifts

Does God want everyone all over the world 
to know that Jesus Came to Save
Sinners? YES! We can tell them!

miracle - Something amazing and special 
that shows God’s power.

prophet - Messenger of God, someone who 
speaks for God
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FOUNDATIONAL TRUTH:

Jesus Came to Save Sinners

“And the angel said to them, ‘Fear not, for 
behold, I bring you good news of great joy 
that will be for all the people. For unto you 

is born this day in the city of David a  
Savior, who is Christ the Lord.’” 

Luke 2:10-11
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